


City of Keller, Texas
Permit and Zoning Commission
City Council

Letter of lntent: 138 Olive Street, Keller

To Whom lt May Concern:

This Letter of lntent is submitted on behalf of Salt and Ught Collective, a Texas LLC, by
owner/members Dale and Marissa Bryson.

138 Olive Street is owned by Main Street Depot and managed by Elaine McDonald. One
por.tion of the property is currently occupied by a retail shop called The Polkadot Giraffe.
The other portion of the property was formerly occupied by Donna's Glfr C/osef, a retail
clothing boutique, but is currently vacant. Sa/t and Light Collective, LLC is seeking to rent
the vacant portion of the property, which is 900 sqft including a front parlor room, a dining
room, and a kitchen.

Salt and Light Collective, LLC (S&L) is a new business which aims to provide Life Skills
classes for the greater Keller community. Examples of the classes to be offered may
include: cooking, arts and crafts, STEM, etc. Small special occasion events and workshops
may also be offered, for example: a birthday party where children make their own
cupcakes, etc.

S&L will operate by reservation only. Classes and events will vary weekly depending on
class and seasonal offerings. We expect to average 3-4 classes or events per week,
ranging from 2-4 hours each. Classes or events may begin as early as 10am, and would
not go later than 9pm. Class sizes aim to be less than 10 students. Event sizes aim to be
less than 30 atendees.

The space for rent at 138 Olive Street is perfectly suited for the needs of S&L. No additions
or modifications to the rooms or building are required or requested. The amount of parking
cunently available at 138 Olive Street is adequate for the operational needs of the
business.

Property manager Elaine McDonald has been in contact with Fire Marshal Debra Crafton
and has confirmed that the 900 sqft rental space at 138 Olive Street does not require any
extra amendments and is up to code for S&L's use case.

Dale and Marissa Bryson have spoken with City Engineer Chad Bartee regarding the
business plan and the potential need for a trip generation analysis. After reviewing the
property data and history along with S&L's intended use of space, Mr. Bartee confirmed
that the Trip Generation Form does not need to be submitted.



We believe that Salt and Light Collective's business model will not only be harmonious with
the surrounding businesses in the Old Town district, but will positively impact the profile
and ongoing improvement efforts in Old Town. S&L's emphasis on life skills, culinary arts,
creative arts etc will contribute to the public perception of OTK as a vibrant destination for
the greater Keller community. S&L will be a complementary neighbor to The Victorian
Tower Event Center, 139 Olive, The Roundhouse, Elm Street Studio, Artful Mayhem and
the diverse foodie community that enioys the restaurants of the area.

Salt and Light Collective aims to build and educate the community one creative moment at
a time. Our goal is to be a bright spark within the growth and revitalization Keller's
downtown district. We look forward to launching our business in Keller, with the support of
Keller P&Z and the City Council. lf you have any questions, please contact Marissa Bryson
at   Thank you for your time and attention!

Sincerely,

Dale Bryson Marissa Bryson
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